May 6, 2010

NORWALK PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

RESPONSE SUMMARY - PROJECT #2915

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

Thank you for your response to our Request for Proposals. The following is a summary of the responses received.

Vendors
Durham School | Baumann & Sons ECS
DATTCO, INC. Services Buses, Inc. First Student STA Of CT, Inc Transportation,
LLC
Total cost for items 1-7 for 2010-2011 $ 4,052,594.00 No Bid $ 5,491,980.00 $ 4,097,459.68 $ 4,398,503.20 $ 423,540.00
Total cost for items 1-7 for 2011-2012 $ 4,182,724.00 No Bid $ 5,781,420.00 $ 4,240,933.99 $ 4,552,320.50 $ 432,540.00
Total cost for items 1-7 for 2012-2013 $ 4,303,936.00 No Bid $ 6,125,220.00 $ 3,838,899.91 $ 4,711,779.80
Total cost for items 1-7 for 2013-2014 $ 4,436,432.00 No Bid $ 6,511,140.00 $ 3,934,884.89 $ 4,876,781.00
Total cost for items 1-7 for 2014-2015 $ 4,579,848.00 No Bid $ 6,808,140.00 $ 4,033,286.78 $ 5,047,451.50
Grand total cost for items 1-7 for 2010-2015 $21,555,534.00 No Bid $30,717,900.00 $20,145,465.26 $23,586,836.00 $ 847,080.00

Note: ECS Transportation proposed costs are for type Il services only.




